CCDE ORDINANCE
CITY OF REDMOND
ORDINANCE NO. 2693

AN  CRDINANCE OF TEE CITY OF REDMOND,
WASHINGTON, AMENDING RMC CHAPTER 15.06 FIRE

CODE, TO CCORDINATE WITH THE 2012
INTERNATIONAL FIRE CCLE AND SUBSEQUENT STATE
AMENDMENTS

WHEREAS, the [Fire Department has recommended that the City
adopt the 2012 International Fire Code, with certain deletions
and amendments, as reqguired by RCW 19.27.031; and

WHEREAS, the City Council, through adoption of this
ordinance, concurs with the recommendations o©f the Fire
Department;

NCOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF REDMOND,
WASHINGTON, DO ORDATIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Clagsification. This ordinance is of a

general and permanent nature and shall become a part of the City

Code.

Section 2. Amendment of Subsections. Subsections RMC

15.06.010 - .013, 15.06.016 - .017, and 15.06.020 - ,021 of the

City of Redmond Fire Code are hereby amended teo read as follows:

Page 1 cof 32 Ordinance No. 2693
AM No. 13-~086



Sections:

15.06.010 Short title.

15.06.011 Adoption.

15.06.012 Restrictions.

15.06.013 Amendments.

15.06.014 Reserved for future use.

15.06.015 Fire detection systems.

15.06.016 Fire sprinkler systens. ‘

15.06.017 Restricted access buildings.

15.06.018 Preventable fire alarms.

15.06.019 MNew materials, processes, oOr occupancies
which may require permits.

15.06.020 Wellhead preotection ordinance coordination.

15.06.,021 Appeals.

15.06.022 Penalties and enforcement.

15.06,023 Building permit issuance and occupancy.

15.06.024 Nonconforming structures.

15.06.010 Short title.

This chapter and amendments heretc shall constitute

the Redmond Fire Code and may be cited as such.

15.06.011 Adoption.

The International Fire Code, [Z2668+ 2012 Edition,
published by the International Code Council including
Appendices Foand I, together with the  amendments,
modifications, and exceptions in  Chapter 51-54 WAC

excluding the changes to IFC Section 503 and 605.11, in

their entirety as the same now exist or as they may be
hereafter amended, except such pocrtions as are hereinafter
by this chapter deleted, modified, amended, or added to,
are hereby adopted and incorporated as fully as if =zet out

at length herein.

Page 2 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693
AM No, 13-086



15.06.012 Restrictions.

(1) Occupancies Prohibited. No Group H, Division 1
occupancy as defined in Section 307, Internaticnal Building
Code, [2868) 2012 Fdition, shall be permitted.

Excepticn No. 1: A Group H, Division 1 occupancy may
be allowed when approved by the Chief and the Building
Official and authorized by a valid PFire Code Permit.

(2) Bulk Plants. Bulk plants referred to in Section
3402 of the International Fire Code, [2889] 2012 Edition,
shall be prohibited throughout the City except in areas
zoned Manufacturing Park (MP) or Industry (I) pursuant to
the City of Redmond Zoning Code and shall be limited to
underground storage only.

Exception No. 1: Unless prohibited by the City of
Redmend Wellhead Protection Ordinance,

{3) Liquefied Petroleum Gas Storage. The limits
referred to in Section [3864+2)] 6104.2 of the International
Fire Code, [2668] 2012 FkKdition, in which bulk storage of
ligquefied ©petrcoleum gas 1s restricted are established
throughout the city limits except areas zoned Manufacturing
Park (MP} or Industry (I) pursuant to the Redmond Zoning
Code.

{4) Flammable Cryogenic Fluids. Flammable c¢yrogenic
fluids referred to in Section [3506] 5806 of the
International Fire Code, [2668] 2012 Edition, shall be
prohibited throughout the City except in areas zoned
Manufacturing Park ({(MP) or Industry (I), or when approved
by the Fire Code 0fficial and the Building 0fficial and

authorized by a valid Fire Code Permit.

Page 3 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693
aAM Ne. 13-086



15.06.013 Amendments.

The following are modifications or amendments to the
International Fire Code, [2888]2012 Edition, as adopted in
RMC 15.06.011 and shall correspond to the context of said
International Fire Code as 1f set out at length in their
respective sections in lieu of or in addition tc published
sections or subsections. Where an amendment or
modification replaces a published section or subsecticn,
the published section or subsection shall be deemed void

and deleted.

(1) Amend 102.7 to read as follows:

102.7 Referenced codes and standards. The codes and
standards referenced in this code shall be the Redmond Fire
Department Standards and those that are listed in Chapter
[4+]80. Such codes and standards shall be considered part
of the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent

of each suech reference and ag further regulated in sections

102.7.1; 102.7.2, and 102.7.3 [as—determined-or—medified by

|
ot

the—F Code—0ffieint]. Redmond Fire Department Standards

3 on
T

o

shall constitute the primary reference document and
guideline. Where differences occur between the provisions
of this code and the referenced standards, the provisions

of this code shall apply.
(2) Add Section 102.7.[+]3 as follows:
102.7.[+]3 Supplemental Rules and Regulations.

The [&HEsFE] Pire Code Official 1s authorized toe render

interpretations of this code and to make and enforce rules

and supplemental requlations in order +to carry out the

Page 4 of 32 Ordinance No, 2693
AM No. 13-086




application and intent of its provisions. Such
interpretations, rules, and regulations shall be known as
“Redmond Fire Department Standards” and shall be in
conformance with the intent and purpose of this code and
shall be available to the public during normal business

hours.

(3) Amend Section 104.11.2 to read as follows:

104.11.2 Obstructing operations.

No person shall obstruct the operations of the fire
department in connection with extinguishment, control, or
investigation of any fire or control of any fire, or
actions relative to other emergencies, or dischey any
lawful command of the fire chief or officer of the fire
department in charge cf the emergency, or any part thereof,
or any lawful order of a police officer assisting the fire

department.

(4) Add Section 104,12 as follows:

104.12 Assistance from other agencies.

Police and other enforcement agencies shall have authority
to render necessary assistance in the enforcement of this
code as reguested by the Fire Code Cfficial.

(5) Amend Section 105.6.23 to read as follows:

105.6.23 Hot work operations.

An operational permit is required for hot work, including

but not limited to:

Page 5 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693
AM No, 13-086



1. Public exhibitions and demonstrations where hot

work 1s conducted.

2. Use of portable hot work equipment inside a
structure.
Exception 1: Work  that is conducted under a

construction permit.
Excepticon Z2: Less than 16 ounces in self-contained,
hand-held devices that do not allow gas flow or flame when

the trigger is released.

3. Fixed-site hot work equipment such as welding
boocths.

4. Het work conducted within a wildfire risk area.

5. Applicaticn of roof coverings with the use of an

open-flame device.

6. When approved, the Fire Code Official shall issue
a permit to carry out a Hot Work Program. This program
allows approved personnel to regulate their facility’s hot
work operations. The approved personnel shall be trained
in the fire safety aspects denoted in this chapter and
shall be respongible for issuing permits regulring
cempliance with the reguirements found in Chapter 26.
These permits shall be issued only to their employees or

het work operations under their supervision.

{6} Amend Section 105.6.27 to read as follows:

1C5.6.27 LP-gas.

An operational permit is required for:

1. Storage and use of LP-gas.

Page 6 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693
AM No. 13-086



Exception 1l: A permit is not required for individual
containers with a 500-gallon (1893 L) water capacity or

less or multiple container systems having an aggregate

gquantity not exceeding 500 gallons {1893L) serving

occupancies in Group R-3.
Exception 2: In other than R-3 occupancies, a permit

is not required in noncommercial outdoor use of propane

barbecue grills.

2. Operation of carge tankers that transport LP-gas.

(7) Add Section 105.6.47 as follows:

105.6.47 Battery systems.

An operational permit is required to operate a stationary
storage battery system having a ligquid capacity of more

than 50 gallons (189 L).

(8) Add Section 105.6.48 to read as follows:

105.6.48 Fire alarm systems.

An operational permit is required when using an approved

Central Station Service alternative,

{9) Add Section 105.6.49, Emergency responder radio

coverage system, as follows:

Section 105.6.49 Emergency responder radic coverage system.

Page 7 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693
AM Wo. 13-086



An operational permit i1s required to operate an emergency
responder radio coverage system as prescribed in Section

510.

(10) Amend Section 105.7.4 to read as follows:

105.7.4 Cryogenic fluids.

A construction permit 1s reguired for installation of or
alteration to stationary cryogenic fluid storage systems
where the system capacity exceeds the amounts listed in
Table 105.6.10. Maintenance performed in accordance with
this code 1s not considered an alteraticn and does not

require a construction permit.

(11) Add Section 105.7.[3+5] 17 as follows:
105.7.[+5] 17 HPM Facilities.

A construction permit is required to install egquipment or
facilities that store, handle, or use hazardous production

materials.
(12) Add Section 105.7.[3+&] 18 as follows:
105.7.[+6] 18 High Piled Storage.

A construction permit 1is required to establish and
construct high piled storage areas exceeding 500 sguare

feet in a building or portion thereof.
(13) Add Section 105.7.[+F] 19 as follows:

105.7. [47] 19 Refrigeration Equipment.

Page 8 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693
AM No. 13-086



A constructicon permit 1s required to install a mechanical
refrigeration unit or system regulated by Chapter 6 of the

IFC.
(14) Add Section 105.7.[3+8] 20 as follows:
105.7.[+8] 20 Places of Assembly.

A construction permit is required for all new Place of

Assembly uses.
(15} Add Section 105.7.[%8] 21 as follows:

105.7.{#8] 21 Smoke Control System. A construction permit

is required for all new installations o¢f, or modifications

to, smoke control systems regulated by Section 909.

(16) Repealed. [ABb—SECTION—305+20—EMERGENCY —RESPONDER

(17) Add Section 110.5 as follows:

110.5 Fire or explosion damaged buildings. The owner,
occupant, or other perscn having under his control any
property or materials on a property damaged by fire or
explosion shall, when ordered by the Chief, immediately
secure the property against entry or unauthorized access by
the public, by boarding up all openings, fencing,
barricading, or utilizing other appropriate measures.

Within 30 days after written notice tc do so has been

Page 9 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693
AM No. 13-086



served, all debris and/or damaged materials shall be
removed from the property and proof furnished that
contractual arrangements have been made for prompt
demolition, replacement, or repalr of all fire or explosion
damaged structures remaining on the property involved in

the fire or explosion.

(18) Add/amend Secticn 202 as follows:

1. 2Amend the definition(s) of “Facility” toc read as

follows:

FACILITY.

A building or use in a fixed location including exteriocr
storage areas for flammable and combustible substances and
hazardous materials, pilers, wharves, tank farms, parks,
plazas, sport fields, o¢r other public assembly areas and
similar wuses. This term includes recreational vwvehicles,
mobile home and manufactured housing parks, sales and

storage lots.
2. Add the following definition(s):
GROSS AREA:

The gross area means the total area of all floors, measured
from the exterior face, outside dimensions, or exterior
colunn line of a building, including basements, cellars,
and balconies, but not including unexcavated arecas. Where
walls and columns are omitted in the construction of a
building, such as an open shed or marguee, the exterior

wall of the open side or sides, for the purpcse of

Page 10 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693
AM No. 13-086



calculating gross area, will be the edge of the rcof,

including gutters,

Power Tap. A listed device for indoor use consisting of an

attachment plug on one end of a flexible cord and two or

more receptacles on the opposite end with overcurrent

protection.

{19) Amend Section 307.1l to read as follows:

307.1 General. A person shall not kindle or maintain, or

authorize to be kindled or maintained, any open burning

unless conducted and approved in accordance with Sections

307.1.1 through 307.5, see also Chaptexr 173-425 WAC.

{20) Amend Section 307.4.3 to read as follows:

307.4.3 Portable outdoor fireplaces. Portable outdoor

fireplaces shall be 1used in accordance with the

manufacturer’s instructions and shall not be operated

within 15 feet (3048 mm) of a structure or combustible

material.

{21l) Add Section 308.1.6.3 as follows:

308.1.6.3 Fixed installations of open flame devices. Fixed

installations of open flame devicesg, including but not

limited to LPG fireplaces and fire pits, shall require

permits as set forth in Section 105.

f+%9+] (22) Amend 314.4 to read as follows:

314.4 Vehicles.

Ordinance No. 2693

FPage 11 of 32
AM No., 13-086



Liquid- or gas-fueled wvehicles, fueled equipment, boats, or

other motorcraft shall not be located indcors except as

follows:
1. Batteries are disconnected.
2. Fuel in fuel tanks does not exceed cne-quarter

tank or 5 gallons (19 L) (whichever 1is least).
3. Fuel tanks and fill openings are closed and
sealed to prevent tTampering.

4, Vehicles, fueled equipment, boats, or other

motorcraft eguipment are not fueled or defueled within the

building.

[+=6)] (23) Add Section 503.1.1.1 to read as feollows:
503.1.1.1 Extent of access.

The fire apparatus access roadway shall extend to within 50
feet of at 1least 25 percent of the perimeter of the
building. Where access roadway cannot be provided, the
Fire Code 0Official is authorized to require an approved
fire protection system or systems as provided in RMC

15.06.017.

Exception: Detached one- and two-family dwelling

units.

[£23F] (24) Add Section 503.1.1.2 to read as follows:
503.1.1.2 Easements.

When directed by the Fire Code Official, emergency vehicle
access routes or areas, including Fmergency Vehicle
Operations Areas, turnarounds, overhang areas, firefighter
access, emergency egress, or similar that are not within a

public right-of-way, shall be maintained in an approved and

Page 12 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693
AM No. 13-086



recorded Emergency Vehicle Access and/or Firefighter Access

Easement.
[£24-] (25) Add Section 503.2.7.1 as follows:
503.2.7.1 Maximum grade.

Al}l required access rcadways shall be constructed so that
The maximum gradient is 10 percent. Where this reguirement
cannot be met, the Fire Code Official is authorized to
require [AM] approved safeguards [FIRE—PROTECTION-SYSTEM—OR
SE¥STEMES—AS—MAY —BE—REQUIRED—BY—FHE—CHIRF] as identified in
RMC 15.06.017.

[+235] (26) Amend Section 503.2.8, to read as follows:

503.2.8 Angles of approach and departure.

The angles of apprecach and departure for fire apparatus
access roads shall be within the limits established by the
Fire Code 0Official based on the fire department’s
apparatus. No access roadway or access road approach to a
public way shall have an arc higher than 12 inches in less
than 20 feet. Where these requirements cannot be provided,
the Fire Code Official 1s authorized to require [AN]
approved safeguards [FIRE—PROFECTION—SYSTEM—OR—SYSTEMS—AS
Moy —Rle—REGOTRED - BY  THE — CHIERR) as identified in RMC
15.06.017.

(42431 (27) Amend Section 503.4.1 as follows:

503.4.1 [FERE—FANES] Obstructions of fire lanes and fire

apparatus access roads. Fire lanes and fire apparatus

access roads shall not be obstructed in any manner,

including the parking of wvehicles. The minimum widths and

Page 13 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693
AM No. 13-086



clearances established in Section 503.2.1 shall be

maintained at all times. The Chief shall have the power

and authority to remcve or cause to be removed without
notice, any vehicle, vessel, or thing parked or placed in
violaticn of Section 503.4 of the International Fire Code.
The Chief may direct a property owner or property manager
of & commercial or multi-family development to have such
vehicles towed and/or contract with a towing company to
have such vehicles towed when necessary to maintain fire
access unobstructed. The owner of any item so removed
shall be respcnsible for all towing, storage, and other

charges connected therewith.
[£25)] {2B) Add Section 505.3 to read as follows:

505.3 Street and road designations. Street and road
designations shall be as determined and assigned by the

Chief.

[£26+] (29) Amend Section 507.5 to read as follows:

507.5 Fire hydrant systems.

Fire hydrant systems shall comply with Sections 507.5.1
through 507.5.6. Hydrant spacing 1n commercial and
multi-family shall be 300' on center; hydrant spacing for
single~family residences shall be 600' on center.

[-£25-1 (30) Amend Section 507.5.1 to read as follows:

507.5.1 Where required.

Page 14 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693
AM No. 13-086



Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter
constructed or moved 1into or within the jurisdiction is
mere than 150 feet from a hydrant on a fire apparatus
access road, as measured by an approved route around the
exterior of the facility or building, on-site fire hydrants

and mains shall be provided where required by the Fire Code

Official.
Exceptions:
1. For group R-3, Group U and one- and two-family

dwellings, the distance requirement shall be 300 feet.

2. For group R=-3, Group U, and one- and two-family
dwellings equipped throughout with an approved automatic
sprinkler system installed in accordance with section

903.3, the distance reguirement shall be 600 feet

(31) Amend Section 507.5.1.1 to read as follows:

507.5.1.1 Hydrant for sprinkler and standpipe systems.

Buildings equipped with a sprinkler or standpipe system

inzstalled in accordance with Section 903 or 905 shall have

a fire hydrant within 40 feet (12.2 m) of the fire

department connections.

Exception: The distance shall be permitted to

exceed 40 feet (12.2 m) where approved by the Fire Code

Official.

[28+] (32) Replace the existing language in section 510
with the follcwing:

Page 15 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693
AM No. 13-086



Section 510 Emergency responder radio coverage.

Emergency responder radio coverage systems shall be
provided in buildings if it is determined by the Fire Code
Official that there is i1nadequate emergency radio coverage
within the building. Such systems shall be installed as

required in Redmond Fire Department Standards.

(33) Amend Section 602 to read as follows:

602.1 Definitions. The following terms are defined in

Chapter 2:
BATTERY SYSTEMS, STATIONARY LEAD-ACID

BATTERY TYPES

COMMERCTIAL COOKING APPLIANCES

HOOD

TZBe T

TIEG IT
POWER TAP

REFRIGERANT

REFRIGERATION SYSTEM

[£363-] (34) Amend Section 603.3 to read as follows:

603.3 PFuel oil storage systems.

Fuel o0il storage systems shall bke installed in accordance

Page 16 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693
BM No. 13-086



with this code. Fuel oill piping systems shall be installed
in accordance with the International Mechanical Code.
Secondary containment shall be provided for all new

installaticns of storage tanks and associated piping.

Exception: Piping that 1s integral to the fuel-fired

appliance.

[234+] (35) Amend Section 901.4.1 to read as follows:
901.4.1 Reguired fire protection systems.

Fire protection systems reguired by this code or the
International Building Code shall be installed, repaired,
operated, tested, and maintained in accordance with this
code., The Redmond Fire Department Standards applicable to
the particular system shall constitute the primary

reference document.

[=22+] (36) Amend Section 901.7 to read as follows:

801.7 Systems out of service.

Where a fire protection system is out of service, the fire
department and the Fire Code 0Official shall be notified
immediately and, where required by the Fire Code Official,
the building shall either be evacuated or an approved fire
watch shall be provided for all occupants left unprotected
by the shutdown until the fire protection system has keen

returned to service.

Where utilized, fire watches shall be provided with at

least one approved means for notification of the fire

Page 17 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693

AM No. 13-086



department and their only duty shall be to perform constant

patrols of the protected premises and keep watch for fires.

[-53)1(37) Add Section 901.[#8] 11 to read as follows:

901.[3+6] 11 Problematic Fire Protection Systems: In the
event of repeated system malfunctions or maintenance
related activations, the Fire Code 0fficial may declare the
system to be a problematic system and is authorized to
direct c¢orrective action to be taken, The Fire Code
Official is authorized to have the fire protection system
placed out of service. The procedures found in Section

901.7 “Systems ocut of service” shall be followed.
[£34)] (38) Amend Section 903.2 to read as follows:
903.2 Where Required.

Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and
structures shall be provided in the locations described in
the Redmond Municipal Code Section 15.06.016 and Sections
803.2.1 through %03.2.12.

[£353] {39) Amend Section 203.4.2 to read as follows:

903.4.2 Alarms.

Approved audible and visible alarm notification appliances
shall be provided for every automatic sprinkler system in
accordance with Section 907 and throughout areas designated
by the Fire Code 0Official. Sprinkler water flow alarm
devices shall be activated by water flow equivalent to the
flow of a single sprinkler of the smallest orifice size
installed in the system. Alarm devices shall be provided

on the exterior of the building 1in an approved location.

Page 18 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693
AM No. 13-086



Where a fire alarm system is installed, activation of the
automatic sprinkler system shall activate the building fire

alarm systemn.

Exception: With approval of the Fire Code Official,
audible and visible alarm notification appliances may be
omitted for approved residential sprinkler systems in 1- or

2-dwelling units if not otherwise specifically required.

[£36+] (40) Amend Section 903.4.3 to read as fellows:
903.4.3 Floor control valves.

Approved supervised indicating control vwvalves shall be
provided at the point of connection to the riser on each

floor in multi-~story buildings.

Exception: When specifically approved by the Fire Code
Cfficial.

[434y] (41) Add Section 905.3.[8] 9 to read as follows:
905.3.[8] 9 High Rise Building Standpipes.

High rise standpipe risers shall be combination
standpipe/sprinkler rigers using a minimum pipe size of 6
inches. Two, 2 1/2 inch hose connections shall be provided
on every intermediate floor level landing in every regquired
stairway. Where pressure reduction wvalves (prv) are
reguired, each hose connecticon shall ke provided with its
own prv. The system shall be designed to provide a minimum
flow of 300 gpm at a minimum pressure of 150 psi (maximum
200 psi) at each standpipe connection, in addition to the

flow and pressure requirements contained in NFPA 14,

Page 19 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693

AM No. 13-086



[£38+] {(42) Amaend Section 907.2 to read as follows:

907.2 Where required - new buildings and structures.

An approved fire alarm system installed in accordance with
the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided
in new buildings and structures where there is a required
sprinkler system, except cne- and two-family dwellings as
defined in the IRC and in accordance with Sections 907.2.1
through 907.23, and provide occupant notification i1n
accordance with Section 907.[6]5, unless required by

another section of this code.

A minimum of one manual fire alarm box shall be provided in
an approved location to initiate a fire alarm signal to
fire alarm systems emplcying automatic fire detectors or
water-flow detection devices. Where other sections of this
code allow elimination o¢f fire alarm boxes due to

sprinklers, a single fire alarm box shall be installed.
Exceptions:

1. The manual fire alarm box is not required for fire

alarm systems dedicated to elevator recall control and

supervisory service.

Page 20 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693
AM No. 13-086



{43) Amend section 1103.8.1 to read as follows:

1103.8.1 Where required. Existing group I-1 and R

single-station smoke

shall be provided with

occupancies
except as

alarms 1in accordance with Section 907.2.11,

provided in sections 1103.8.2 and 1103.8.3.

Page 21 of 32 Crdinance No. 2693
AM No. 13-086




Exception: Where smoke detectors connected to a fire

alarm system have been installed as a substitute for smoke

alarms.

[425] (44) Amend Secticn [HH3] 3311.1 to read as

follows:
[433-3] 3311.1 Stairways reqguired.

Where a building has been constructed to a bullding height
of 50 feet or four stories as measured Ifrom the lowest
level of fire department wvehicle access, or where an
existing building exceeding 50 feet in bulilding height is
altered, at least cne temporary lighted stairway shall be
provided unless one or more of the permanent stairways are

erected as the construction progresses.

[-+433] (45) 2Amend Secticon ([2464-5-F] 5001.5.1 to read as

follows:

[£701-5-—2+] 5001.5.1 Hazardous Materials Management Plan.

Where required by the Fire Code 0Official, an application
for a permit =shall include a Hazardous Materials Management
Plan (HMMP) . The HMMP shall include a facility site plan

designating the following:

1. Access to each storage and use area.

2. Location of emergency equipment.

3. Location where liaison will meet emergency
responders.
4. Facility evacuation meeting point locations.
Page 22 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693

AM No. 13-086



5. The general purpose of other areas within the
building.

6. Location of all above-ground and underground tanks
and thelr appurtenances, including but not limited to,
sumps, vaults, below grade treatment systems, and piping.

7. The hazard classes in each area.

8. Locations of all control areas and Group H
occupancies.

9. Emergency exits.

10. Location of spill control eguipment.

[+443] (46) Amend Section [2F4+——=2] 5001.5.2 to read as

[2703-5-2] 5001.5.2 Hazardous Materials Inventory Statement
(HMIS) .

Where reguired by the Fire Code 0Official, an application
for a permit shall include an HMIS. The HMIS shall be
provided using a Redmond Fire Department approved format.

The HMIS shall include the following information:
Manufacturer’s name.

1
2. Chemical name, trade names, hazardous ingredients.

3 Hazard classification.

4 MSDS or equivalent.

5. United Nations ({UN), North America (NA) or the
Chemical Abstract Service (CAS) identification number.

6. Maximum guantity stored or used cn-site at one time.

7. Storage conditions related to the storage type,

temperature, and pressure.

Page 23 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693
AM No. 13-08s6



[H45] (47) Amend Section [2783+%] 5003.1 +to read as

follows:

[(2983=—%] B003.1 Scope. The sgtorage, use, and handling of
all hazardous materials shall be in accordance with this
section and shall comply with the provisions of the City of

Redmond Wellhead Protection QOrdinance.

[H46¥] (48) Add section [2F683-5-3%] 5003.9.11 as follows:

[203-9-313] 5003.9.11 Manufacturer’s limitatiocns. The
storage and use of hazardous materials shall not exceed the
manufacturer’s limitations on shelf 1life and any other

restrictions on use.

4] (49) Amend Section [2784-2+-2] 5004.2.2 to read as

[2704+7-2] D5004.2.2 Secondary containment for hazardous

material liguids and solids.

Where required by Table [2904-2-2] 5004.2.2 buildings,
rocoms, areas, tanks, and associated piping or areas used
for the storage of hazardous materials, liquids, or solids
shall be provided with secondary containment in accordance
with this section when the capacity of an individual vessel
or the aggregate capacity of multiple vessels exceeds the

following:

1. Liquids: Capacity of an individual vessel exceeds
55 gallons (208 L) or the aggregate capacity of multiple
vegsels exceeds 1,000 gallons (3785 L); and

Page 24 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693

AM No. 13-086



z2. Sclids: Capacity of an individual wvessel exceeds
550 pounds (250 kg) or the aggregate capacity of multiple
vessels exceeds 10,000 pounds (4540 kg).

[44+] (B0) Add Section [323688-+—3431] 5608.1.1 as follows:
[336081+2] 5608.1.1 Fireworks.

Refer to Chapter 9.26 RMC (Fireworks) and to RCW 70.77.120

et seq. (State Fireworks Law).

[+43}] (51) Add Section [2483-4-3] 5703.4.1, to read as

follows:
[3403-4-+] 5703.4.1, Secondary Containment.

Secondary containment shall be provided for all new

installations of storage tanks and associated piping.

15.06.016 Fire Sprinkler systems.

The following regulations constitute general

requirements for fire sprinkler systems.

All approved fire sprinkler systems shall meet the
requirements of the Redmond Fire Department Standards,
Redmond Fire Code, and the applicable NFPA Standards. All
systems shall have an adequate water supply, system of
piping, and sprinkler heads designed to discharge water on
a fire at an appropriate time and in an effective manner.
All underground sprinkler supply piping shall be included
on c¢ivil drawings and shall be approved by the water

supplier and the Redmond Fire Department.

Page 25 of 32 Ordinance No, 2693

AM No. 13-086



An area separation wall or fire wall, or occupancy
separation or fire barrier wall, or a distance of 10 feet
cr less shall not constitute a separation between two

structures on the same property.

For the purposes of this section, the following definition

shall apply:

Gross Area. The greoss area means the total area of all
floors, measured from the exterior face, outside dimensions
or exterior column line of a building, including basements,
cellars, and balconies, but not Including unexcavated
areas. Where walls and columns are omitted in the
construction of a building, such as an open shed or
marqguee, the exterior wall of the open side or sides, for
the purpose of calculating gross area, will be the edge of

the roof, including gutters.

Where Required. An approved fire sprinkler system shall be

required in the following structures

1) Commercial

{a) In any structure where the gross area is 3,000
square feet or mecre

{b) In any structure where the calculated fire flow
demand exceeds available flow.

{c) In buildings with an A-2 occupancy where one or

more of the following exists:

. An occupant lcad greater than 100,
? 3 [AN—A—2—F I RE AREA—EXCEEBS—5000—S0UARE—FRET
OR]
Page 26 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693

AM No. 13-086



. An A~2 fire area is located con a floor other
than the level of exit discharge.
{d) All nightclubs, defined as follows:
Nightclub. An  A-2 Occupancy use under the 2012

Internaticnal Building Cecde in which the aggregate area of
concentrated use of unfixed chairs and standing space that
is specifically designated and primarily used for dancing
or viewing performers exceeds three hundred fifty square
feet, excluding adjacent lobby areas. "Nightclub" does not
include theaters with fixed seating, banquet halls, or

lodge halls.

(e} In any building with an assembly occupancy where

the total cccupant load of the building is over 200.

(£) Existing commercial buildings, where one of the
following applies:
. Additions resulting in a gross area Jgreater
than 5,000 square feet, or
. Sprinklers may be required in buildings that
undergo a change of use or occupancy; refer to IFC Section

102.3.

{2) Residential - One- and Two-Family Dwellings:

{a) An approved automatic fire sprinkler system shall
be installed in new one- and two-family dwellings and
townhouses as described 1in the International Residential
Code in accordance with Section 903.3.1 of the

International Fire Code, [2888] 2012 Edition.

Page 27 of 32 Crdinance No., 2693
AM No. 13-086



Exception: This subsection (2) (a) does not require the
installation of an apprcved fire sprinkler system in any
mokile home or manufactured home. This exception 1is
limited to this subsection (2)(a) and nothing herein
exempts a mobille home or manufactured home from any other
requirement to install an approved automatic fire sprinkler
system under any other section cr subsection of this code

or of any international code adopted by the City.

(b) Existing detached one- and two-family dwelling
units where additions result in a gross area greater than
6,000 sqguare feet must be retrofitted with an automatic

sprinkler sgystem throughout.

Exception: Additions to detached one- or two-family
dwellings of up to 500 sguare feet are permitted without
cempliance with this section. This is a one-time
exemption, and this exemption must be recorded with King
County Records and Elections.

(3) Where required elsewhere by the Redmond Fire Code

or the International Building Code.

15.06.017 Restricted access buildings.

(1) Where a building or portion of a building is so
located or constructed with grades, elevations, vegetation,
or other natural or manmade obstacles which make exterior
or interior access and/or use by fire apparatus, equipment,
or personnel unduly difficult, unsafe, or impossible,
additional safeguards may be reqguired Dby the Fire Code
Official. Where such access is being proposed as part of a

land subdivision, the Fire Code 0fficial may declare a

Page 28 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693
AM No. 13-086



proposed lot unaccessible and therefore deny that proposed
lot. Safeguards may consist of one or more of the
following applicable items or alternates suitable for
firefighting, fire protection, EMS, and/or rescue
operations as specified by the Fire Code Official:

(a) Automatic fire sprinklers throughout,

(b} Smoke detection system.

(¢) Automatic fire alarm system.

{d) Communication system.

(i) Voice alarm system;

(1ii) Public address system;

(iii}) Fire department communication system.

(e) Central control station.

{f) Smoke control system.

{g) Lmergency elevator system.

(h) Emergency exits.

(1) Emergency areas of refuge including
horizontal exits and smoke-proof enclosures,.

{71} Vertical and horizontal standpipes.

(k) Standby power, light, and emergency systems.

(1) Emergency medical services-sized elevator (4
®x 7' c¢lear interior).

{m) Reduction or deletion of non-sprinklered
arsas.

{n) Fire-resgsistive construction.

{o) Noncombustible siding (limited, protected, or
no openings).

(p) NFPA 13 compliant sprinkler coverage.

(g} Brushed concrete access drive or similar.

(r) Firefighter access stairs/ramps.

{s) Ladder operations area (not Jjust aerial but

also ground ladders).

Page 29 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693
AM No. 13-086



(t}) Electrically controlled access doors or gates

provided with emergency services override (strobe, radio,

ete.)

(u) Dedicated Emergency Service access and

parking areas.

(2) All systems shall meet the design requirements set
forth in the Redmond Fire Department Standards and Redmond

Fire Code.

15.06.020 Wellhead protection ordinance coordination.

Fire Department construction and maintenance, reviews
and inspections occur within Wellhead Protection Zones
established within the RMC and the Redmond Zoning Code. &
major component of these fire department reviews and
inspections 1s the verification that storage, handling,
use, and operaticns invelving hazardous materials comply
with adopted codes. In order to coordinate and minimize
overlap in the enforcement of the Redmond Fire Code with
wellhead protection regulations, the following shall apply:

1. Regulations imposed through the Wellhead Protection
Ordinance (WPO) are enforceable by the Fire Code Official.

2. Where, within a particular wellhead protection
zone, a threshold amount noted within the WPO is less than
the threshold in the Redmond Fire Code, the lower threshold
shall apply and be enforceable by the Fire Ccde Official,

3. The Fire Code Official shall exercise authority
over all Hazardous Materials Inventory Statements and
Hazardous Material Management Plans for materials regulated
by the Redmond Fire Code.

4. The Fire Department shall have the authority to

enforce rules governing “deleterious substances” for such

Page 30 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693
AM No. 13-086



substances so identified by the Redmeond Natural Rescurces
Department. Substances sc identified by Natural Resources
shall be listed under the =subcategory “other health
hazards” of Hazardous Materials. Other health hazards may
include irritants, sensitizers, pyropheoric, unstable-
reactive, or radioactive material, as identified by the

Fire Code Official.

15.06.021 Appeals.

Whenever the Fire Code Official or designee
disapproves an applicaticon or refuses to grant a permit
applied for, or when it is c¢laimed that the provisions of
the code do not apply or that the true intent and meaning
of the code has been misconstrued or wrongly interpreted,
the applicant may appeal to the Chief of the Fire
Department in accordance with the procedures for Type 1

review, Redmond Zoning - Code 21.76.060(D) [Sectiocn

21+-T6-050(F7] . Bppeals from the decisions of the Chief to
the Hearing Examiner shall be made as prescribed in Redmond

Zoning Code Section 21.76.060(D) (4).

Section 3. Effective Date. This ordinance shall take

effect five (5) days after passage and publication of an

approved summary consisting of the title.

Page 31 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693
AM No. 13-086



ADCPTED by the Redmond City Council this 4th day of June,

2013.

CITY OF REDMOND

JOHN MARCHICONE, MAYOR
ATTEST:

Wﬂcgﬁ/ WYLLW C (sEan)

MiﬁﬂELLE M. MCGEHEE MMC, CITY CLERK

APPROVED AS TO FORM:
OFFICE OF THE CITY ATTORNEY:

%A%

JAMES HENEY, CT TORNEY

FILED WITH THE CITY CLERK: May 29, 2013
PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL: June 4, 2013
SIGNED BY THE MAYOR: June 4, 2013
PUBLISHED: ©~ June 10, 2013
EFFECTIVE DATE: June 15, 2013

ORDINANCE NO. 2693

APPROVED 7-0: Allen, Carson, Flynn, Margeson, Mysers, Stilin and Vache

Page 32 of 32 Ordinance No. 2693
AM No., 13-086



